EVAN GUTMAN

From: Springdfield, Frank <fspringfield@burr.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 1:22 PM

To: EVAN GUTMAN

Cc: Bridges, Gennifer

Subject: RE: Gutman v. Cavalry Portfolio Se

| have discussed your email with Cavalry and been authorized fto offer you $5,000, plys waiver of the underlying debt to
resolve this matter. In exchange for any settlement, Cavalry ign its confidential general release

and would also require that the appeal and the underlying action ismissed with prejudice. Please let me know your
response to this offer.

From: EVAN GUTMAN <egutman@gutmanvaluations.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 9:55 AM

To: Springfield, Frank <fspringfield@burr.com>

Cc: Bridges, Gennifer <gbridges@burr.com>

Subject: RE: Gutman v. Cavalry Portfolio Services

[EXTERNAL EMAIL]

| have no demand or offer of any nature to make at this time. That said, you certainly may email me
any written offers at any time as you deem appropriate and | may respond to the extent | deem
appropriate.

EVAN GUTMAN CPA, JD

Boca Raton, Florida 33432
561-990-7440

201-400-6459 (Cell)
egutman@gutmanvaluations.com
Website: www.gutmanvaluations.com

From: Springfield, Frank <fspringfield@burr.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 10:50 AM

To: EVAN GUTMAN <egutman@gutmanvaluations.com>
Cc: Bridges, Gennifer <gbridges@burr.com>

Subject: RE: Gutman v. Cavalry Portfolio Services

Ok. Can you please let me know if you have a demand to resolve this case that | can take to my client?

From: EVAN GUTMAN <egutman@gutmanvaluations.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 9:38 AM

To: Springfield, Frank <fspringfield@burr.com>

Cc: Bridges, Gennifer <gbridges@burr.com>

Subject: RE: Gutman v. Cavalry Portfolio Services




[EXTERNAL EMAIL]

Frank,

| received your two voicemails. In order to avoid any miscommunications, my preference is for all
communications between us to be in writing at this time. Please feel free to email me as you deem fit
and | shall respond to the extent | deem appropriate.

Very truly yours,
"~ Evan Gutman CPA, JD

EVAN GUTMAN CPA, JD

Boca Raton, Florida 33432
561-990-7440

201-400-6459 (Cell)
egutman@gutmanvaluations.com
Website: www.gutmanvaluations.com

From: Springfield, Frank <fspringfield@burr.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 10:13 AM

To: EVAN GUTMAN <egutman@gutmanvaluations.com>
Cc: Bridges, Gennifer <gbridges@burr.com>

Subject: Gutman v. Cavalry Portfolio Services

Evan,

I have left you several messages about the appeal you have filed in the above matter but | have yet to receive a response
from you. If you will please give me a call. Thanks.

R. Frank Springfield
Partner
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